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Emergency teams train for disaster
Local and county emergency

teamsare ready for any disaster
if Tuesday's mock nuclear prac-
tice drill at Kings Mountain
High School was an indication.
Teams from police, fire, res-

cue, emergency, HASMET dis-
aster team, Department of
Social Services and and Red
Cross put up a shelter in the mi-
ni gymnasium with nurses and
staff to simulate what they
would do in the case of a nucle-
ar fallout at the Catawba
Nuclear Plant.
"Victims contaminated"

showered in a mock shower
stall and were taken quickly to
a quarantined area of the safe
shelter away from those who
were "clean."
The Cleveland County

Emergency Management Office
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- sNON-SURGICAL treatment

which is SAFE and

PAINLESS

*78% EFFECTIVE in relieving
your lower back pain.

sEffective Treatment for:
sHerniated Disc
eDegenerative Disc
eFacet Syndrome

eSpinal Stenosis
* ePre/Post Surgical Patients

*Pre-determined treatment

period

led “the practice drill.
Participants practiced the skills
needed to successfully evacuate
citizens in the event of a general
emergency at the Catawba
Nuclear Station in York, SC.
Some of these skills are operat-
ing areception center for evac-
uees, establishing roadblocks,

mobilizing personnel and get-
ting emergency information to
the media.

Participating in the drill from
this area were the Kings
Mountain Fire Department, the
Kings Mountain Police
Department, and Bethlehem
and Grover Fire Departments.

Assistant Fire Marshal
Dewey Cook supervised the
drill along with members of the
State Emergency Response
Team.

WHATIS The DRS System™?
The DRS System™is a

mechanized, high-tech pain

reduction and healing system

that was developed after many

years of careful research and

development by renowned
  
  

  

*Recognized by the
AMERICAN ACADEMY OF
PAIN MANAGEMENT

neurosurgeon and researcher,

C. Norman Shealy, M.D., Ph.

D., EA.C.S. Dr. Shealy began
   
  Covered by most insurance his career at Harvard

University School of Medicine.
  
  
  
  

  
   

  

  
  

  
  

 

Treatment of herniated
and degenerative discs

without surgery.

Nowyou can live painfree.

Now Open& Accepting New Patients

824-5611
Dennis Watts, D.C.

235 Market Street, Cramerton

 

A similar drill was under-
way at the same time in Gaston,
Union and Mecklenburg coun-
ties.

John Moore, evaluator of the
federal emergency management
organization called FEMA, was

on hand to test the local res-
cuers involved in the exercise
and Boy Scouts volunteered to
be the "victims."

" Kings Mountain Fire Chief
Frank Burns said drills are held
every two years in Kings
Mountain because ifsuch an ac-
cident occurred that the over-
flow victims from Gaston
County would be rushed to
Kings Mountain.

"I think the drill was quite
successful,” said Burns. Now

There’s
A Real

Solution.

SIMULATE DISASTER - Emergency teams from the city and county conducted a mock drill
Tuesday to be ready for a disaster that could result in nuclear contamination. FEMA evaluator

Josh Moore, left, KM Fire Chief Frank: Burns and HASMET team member Gary Ramsey help a
"victim." ii

Board to discuss safety program
School bus drivers could soon

get cellular telephones to use as
part of the school system's safe-
ty program.

Supt. Dr. Bob McRae said
School Bus Coordinator Greg
Payseur will present a proposal
for the telephones at Monday's
Board of Education meeting at 7
p-m. at the Administration
building on Ridge Street.
McRae said the installation of

telephones would also give par-
ents a measure of safety be-
cause in a problem they could
reach their children and bus
drivers could call immediately
in emergency situations and not
have to walk to a nearby house

Phillips wins for
Kings Mountain's Clay

Phillips has helped get Gaston
Christian School's baseball team
off to a 2-0 start.

in case of a breakdown or acci-
dent.
"Greg Payseur has done a

good job in working up some
proposals for us to look at
Monday," he said.

McRae said the board will re-
view a draft of the 1998-99 local
budget proposal and is expect-
ed to schedule a budget hearing
for Monday, April 20, to which
the public is invited to give in-
put.

A calendar committee will al-
so present recommendations for
revision of the 1998-99 school
calendar necessitated by
changes in state law and school

Gaston Christian
hurled a complete game 4-2 vic-
tory over Charlotte Christian.
He gave upfive hits and struck
out six.

level calendar plans for 1998-99
as prescribed by state law.
McRae said the board will

hear about plans for summer
programs, including a
Champions of Tomorrow base-
ball icamp, ithe: 1998
Mountaineer baseball camp and
summerclay camp.
The board is expected to take

action on gifted education,
school improvement and safe
schools plans which they dis-
cussed at recent board meetings
and during the recent work ses-
sion. McRae said the programs
are in line with theboard goals
for the year and are part of state
requirements.
He said the board will also

consider a proposal from
Occupational Safety Solutions, a
private company familiar with
OSHA and EPA requirements,
to provide assistance in being
certain the system meets appli-
cable OSHA and environmen-
tal regulations.

Phillips went 3-for-3 with
three RBI in an 11-1 win over Kings Mountain's Greg Jarvis
Northside Christian, and he also plays for Gaston Christian.

 

 

  
  

 

Come in and enjoy our Grand Opening Special, everything
on menu is half price (excludes steaks and ice cream).

 

Dixon School Road, Kings Mtn.
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Don’t forget our Sunday Special!

We will have a different Lunch

Special every Sunday! *4.99  
 

   

 

Mon. Sun.
6 am - 10 pm

730-1882

Off I-85 Exit §  
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