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.1$ KING’S BAPTISTS TO
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lhal will be made on Dr King's 
birthday this January 15th with 
the National Office of the 
Southern Christian Leadership 
(Yniference (in light of the fact 
that Mrs. King and the Center 
are fully aware that the true 
custodian of Dr. King's work - 
lhal IS. the National Office of 
SCl.C is dying, (mainly due to 
a lack of funds! forces us in the 
Atlanta Chapter to break oiir 
silence on what is truly 
happening (o the works of Dr. 
King on several occasions 

a the National Office of 
1C •creived funds (even 

though [’resident Abernathy 
needed these funds to effective­
ly continue and develop the 
works of Dr. King) for unity 
.'ake. he divided those badly 
•leerted funds with Mrs King 
and her Center

"We in the Atlanta Chapter 
ire convinced that the most- 
needed w ay to honor Dr King's 
birthday is to be almut 
l.ittiii hing and implementing 
■lon.e action-type programs that 
'Viil revive th^ true -''orks of our 
I’RINCK OK PEACE There­
for e. as President of the Atlanta 
t,'h.a|iler of SCLC I call upon 

■ Mrs King - who still has the 
- abilil.v to develop the resources 
: ! and Dr Abernathy - who still 
: has (he ability to develop the 

plai; fo liberate us - to join hands 
and lead us in a human rights 
coalition to plan, organize, and 
iiiipleinent THE SECOND 
KECON.STRl'CTION of this 
great man's works

I'ruth compels us to further 
break our silence on the 
confiniialion of Dr King's 
works by admitting that his 
works arc not only unfinished, 
they are dying The poor people 
in Atlanta, in Georgia, and 
across this country are asking 
the (|iieslion. "What happened 

I die movement'’" Therefore, 
■ini'', (here is a Reformation of 
Dr King's works; white racists 
inialit have killed the man, but 
v.e will have killed his dream. 
We've had enough deflections: 
we've had enough empty 
words we've had enough press 
coiiicrcnces - what we need now 
IS lo reconstruct the works of 
our iK'loved fallen Leader 
throngh action.

A^ a beginning, the Atlanta 
Chapter of SCLC is calling for a 
Birlbdav March this January 
ir>(h 'a "HUNGER DEATH 
MARCH" in support of Dr 
King's works - against the 
(lower structure of Atlanta in 
the person _ of Mayor Sam 
Massell. wh(') is committed to 

'htpression of the poor instead of 
liebabilitalion, and against 

^Governor Jimmy Carter, who 
publicly stated during his 

'innaug'ural address that justice 
-would be “the motivating 
force" behind his administra­
tion, but who refused to act 
justly by benignly neglecting lo 
declare January 15th a state 
people's holiday in honor of our 
KING OK JUSTICE - the 
Reverend Dr. Martin Luther 
King. Jr.

"Jimmy Carter refused to 
declare King’s birthday a 
holidav in Georgia, but did 
declare a day of m" Tning in 
Georgia for Harry Truman's 
funeral. All state office build- 
tings were closed, and state 
.'employees were paid to give 
.honor to the war-mongering 
33rd President of America. Lest 
'*e forget, it was Harry Truman 
•who ordered 'he atomic bombs
.drop(>( I ..... ishima that
Jiilled ac ' ‘'or two
hundred tho. women
and children. G( aliens un- 
^rn will be affected by the 
■radioactivity from the bombs 
.drop(red on brown Japanese and 
pot order the bombs drop[)ed on 
'lyhile facist Germany.
■ "Jimmy Carter refused lo 
fight the proposed reinactment 
of a state death penalty in 
Georgia, even though the 
^preme Court has ruled the 
death penalty as applied is 
unconstitutional. If James Earl 
Ray - the white racist paid to 
kill King - was not executed for 
killing King then no one should 
be ordered executed as punish­
ment for killing anyone. Jimmy 
Carier does not object to the 
bombing of Vietnam and 
hereby supports the Wallace- 
Nixonite position asserting that 
bombs bring peace in Vietnam.
. ‘"rhese are but a few of the 

many reasons why we, as an 
oppressed people, should take 
off of work on Monday, January 
J5th, and participate in demon- 
ptrations against the power 
Structure and in support of 
tehabilitaling Dr. King's works. 
Finaily and foremost we should 
rarticipate in protest activities 
^aiise white America, whose 
leaders pubiicly praised Dr. 
King and attended his funeral 
mid marched behind the 
.mule drawn wagon carrying his 
body, have refused to give 
honor to our Prince o‘f Peace by 
declaring January 15th and 
April -Ith "People's Holidays." 
&nce Dr. King, like Jesus, lived 
for the poor and was crucified 
for preaching and teaching his 
brothers and sisters the princi­
ples of true love: peace; and 
brotherhood. Dr. King's birth­
day and crucifixion date, iike 
Jesus, should be international 
holidays.

"The Atlanta Hunger-Death 
Marcli to honor our "King of 
King^ " left his holy tomb at 
Ebenezer Baptist Church at 
1:00 pm. on Monday, January 
15th. 1973. We will journey first 
to City Hall and then to the State 
Capitol."

Taiwan wins World Cup 
golf; U.S. lies for 4th.

^ (Continued from p l’
where<)m nepartmenis will hold 
their sessions. January 2J-2r>. 
1973. Scheduled bus H ips will be 
made to visit the convention’s 
headquarters properly and the 
newly completed Million Dollar 
Administration and (’lassroom 
Building at the Burroughs 
School.

President L V Booth will be 
supported by a distinguished 
group ot leaders which will 
include First Vice President. 
Nelson H Smith and .Second 
Vice President. T Koberl 
Washington. The headquarters 
drive will be led by Dr (lardner 
r Taylor, former president. 
The direction and implementa­
tion of a nearly half million 
dollar budget for 1973 will be 
led by Dr Thomas Kilgore. Jr . 
president of ralifornia and 
Nevada Baptists 

More than I.ihhi It.ip'i-w| 
messengers will met-i 
consider:

Baptist World Alliance Sun­
day. The 7..-) million dollar drive 
sponsored b> .American Baptist 
(’hurchesand I*rogressi\e Itap- 
lists, led by Dr Joseph O. Bass. 
National Director. Ketiromenl 
Insurance lor .Mlnisfer^ and 
laymen and f’hurch (Iroup Fire 
Insurance. Implementation ol 
the 1973 budget and expansion 
of both home and foreign 
mission work

One of the truly great 
highlights of the entire meeting 
will be the report ol the first 
observance of Martin l.ulher 
King. Jr Sunday which will be 
observed by Progressive Bap­
tist Churches and other church 
bodies on the third Sunday in 
January, which precedes the 
Admourned Session 

Miss Violet Ankrum. presi­
dent of the Women's Depart­
ment and all of the other 
departmental heads will be well 
represented and will conduct 
programs well coordinated with 
the Pastor's Sessions The 
Pre Convention .Musical will 
include most of the churches of 
the DC. Progressive Baptist 
Fellowship and will be held on 
Tuesday evening. January 23 at 
the Shiloh Baptist Church 
(formerly pnstored by the late 
President Lari L. Harrison) 
now pastored by tho Rev Henry 
C. Gregory. Ill, formerly of 
Fifth Street Baptist Church. 
Richmond, Va.

The closing sermon will t)e 
delivered on Thursday evening 
by the Rev Otis Moss. Jr of 
Cincinnati. Ohio.

.All activities of the conven­
tion are coordinated and 
expedited by Dr. S. S. Hodges. 
Kxeculive secretary, whose 
office is in Washington. D C. 
The convention will welcome 
several new churches. The 
public is invited

INSULTED
(Continued from p. 1) 

editor of The CAROLINIAN, 
last July, and Officer J. S. 
Burge asked him for his 
driver’s license and also asked 
Poole if he realized he was 
doing 45 in a 35 mile per hour 
zone. Mr. Poole said he told him 
no, he didn’t realize it.

Poole, who works for the 
state, is in charge of some fifty 
parolees.

At this point. Officer Sneeden, 
the driver of the police car, got 
out of the car and Mr. Poole 
asked the other officer if he 
minded huri\ing up and write 
the speeding ticket, so that he 
could get back to the (hiireh .md 
do his job as an ushei.

Sneeden came around on 
Poole’s side of the car and Die 
first thing that he said was “we 
got a job to do. then pointed his 
finger in Poole's face and said 
if you don't shut up. I'll place 

you under arrest,” then grab­
bed Poole by the right arm and 
slightly shoved him in the back 
seat of the car.

At the magistrate’s office. 
Sneeden did not charge Poole 
with any crime except speed­
ing. Mr. Poole, who was about 
25 minutes late, asked Sneeden 
to drive him back to the church. 
which is at least five miles from 
the magistrate's office and was 
told by Sneeden. "No. no we 
don't do that.”

As Mr. Poole approached the 
corners of Fayetteville and 
Martin Streets, he met A1 Willis, 
a local cab driver, whom he 
(Poole) {Said $1.65 to take him 
back to the church.

The police car left its post at 
the intersection of Wade Avenue 
and Oberlin Road, just to drive 
Poole to the magistrate's office.

Many charges have beer, 
made at the Raleigh Police 
Station about Sneeden and his 
reported Gestapo-like attitude 
toward black Raleigh citizens 

The cop told Jones of The 
CAROLINIAN. "If you don’t put 
your (left) hand back on tup of 
that car (mine). I’ll break your 
arm. Legal action is still 
pending in that case as to 
whether Jones will sue him. Mr. 
Poole said he will definitely 
lake legal action.

APPRECIATION
(Continued from p. i)

the Warehouse of Tires adver­
tisement on page 10 last week 
Warehouse of Tires is located at 
325 South Person Street at the 
corner of East Davie Street. 
Natural Health Foods ad 
carried the name of Mrs 
Snellings. Natural Health Foods 
is located at 8 E. Hargett Street 
Rhodes Furniture Company’s 
advertisement carried the 
name of Mrs Terrell.

You. too. may be a winner

Check the advertisements on 
page 12 of this week's paper. 
Persons who see their names in 
(he ads SHOULD NOT go 
directly to the merchants 
involved but come FIRST to the 
office of this newspaper, located 
at 518 E Martin Street, so that 
we can identify you. Please 
remember that the deadline for 
claiming your money is noon on 
tho Monday following the 
appearance of your name in the 
paper, this week on page 12.
^The CAROLINIAN WILL 

!sOT PAY Appreciation .Money 
lo survivors of deceased 
persons whose names happen to 
be chosen out of the City 
Directorv as are all of the
names.

ROY WILKINS
(roiilinued from p 1) 

riisii[>[>iiinlmen( last year was 
Hie I’residential race and 
cleclion last November.

He called Senator George 
M'.overn. the Democratic 
I’leMdenii.nl nominee, "wishy- 
washy on the hosing issue."

Devoling a lot of his sfieech to 
the Kederal government, Wil­
kins said il has not fought for 
jotis tor black workers.

He maintained the Associa­
tion would accelerate its opposi­
tion to the appointment of Peter 
.1, Brennan as Secretary of 
I.ahor Brennan is president of 
Ihe Slate and City Building and 
Construction Trades Council nf 
New- York

"Brennan has been a very 
real obstacle lo the employment 
of blacks in the construction 
industry, " Wilkins said.

The NAACP-head pointed out 
lhal the orgatiizalion's mem 
liershij) went up. from 22,(X)0 lo 
412,00(1 last .vear. The treasury 
is in good shape and the NAACP 
will conimue to gel involved in 
Ihe areas of housing, employ­
ment and education.

Other words of caution and 
dismay were echoed by other 
NAACP leaders:

".Alter they hear Nixon's code 
words, Ihe whites in Mississippi 
say they don't have to obey the 
laws anymore. " said Henry, 
who has been active in state 
Democratic Party Politics.

Henry said he feared blacks 
were being attracted to more 
militant apiwals as the Admin- 
islralion's "anti-black" [mlicies 
become evident As an example 
ol this, Henry [minted to the 
return recently of Stokley 
Carmichael.

Another NAACP official. Rev. 
Emmett Burns, field director in 
.Mississippi, says the racial 
situalinn is worse in the South.

"But it's worse in the Deep 
•Soulh than up North. Back 
home it’s a matter of life and 
death." he said.

Elected to the Board of 
Directors this year were: Dr. 
Stephen Gill Spottswood, Wash­
ington: Dr. Charles Roque- 
more, Wellington, Kan.; Mrs. 
Sarah Greene, Louisville, Ky,; 
Dr. Claude Hudson. Los Ange­
les: Matthew Perry, Columbia, 
S.C.; Irene Smith, Wenonah, 
N.J.; Leonard Woodcock, De­
troit, and the Rev. Emerson J. 
Marcer. San Antonio, Tex.

PROGRAMS
(Continued from p. 1) 

President Nixon has an­
nounced his determination to 
hold federal spending to $250 
billion this fiscal year, and 
blacks have contended that he 
will make the bulk of his cuts in 
the social-oriented programs 
which were begun during the 
Johnson Administration.

In order lo meet his 
1 ■ virnced goal, the President 
w ill h ive to slash some $17 
billion lut nf programs already 
appro >ated by the Congress.

Kew Ol the (irnixised cutbacks 
have been anniomced officially, 
but various a^pocts of his 
program are leaking out lo the 
press now and it offers a clear 
usurption of the Congressional 
constitutional power of the 
purse, many ttemocratic con­
gressional leaders have charg­
ed

The manpower programs, 
which are administered by the 
Labor Department, have long 
been a target of massive budget 
cuts by the President since he 
views them in an unfavorable 
light generally and has con­
tended that they just don’t 
work.

A spokesman for the Labor 
Department said the freeze 
directive was merely a "review 
of our expenditures," but 
sources close to the department 
say otherwise.

"It's the beginning of a 
massive reduction in these kind 
of programs." one source said. 
"The handwriting has be«n on 
the wall a long Jime. and it is 
finally happening."

Last month, the Labor 
Department sent telegrams to 
Us regional administrators 
ordering the freeze and advis­
ing them not to enter into new 
agreements with manpower 
programs.

More than $1.6 million is now 
spent on various manpower 
training programs - many of 
lliem welfare recipients who 
are trying desperately lo get oft 
•lie welfare rolls Tliis amount, 
coupled with auoilier $1 billion 
for public service jobs in local 
governments, has increased 
greatly the [xissihiy of the black 
workers in local communities of 
getting good jobs.

NC NAACP
iContinued from p. 1) 

not getting their share of 
low-mcome liuusing tor disad- 
vanlaged eiti/ens" and he

urged NAACP leaders and 
others to attend this meeting to 
hear for themselves what 
William Morris. National Di­
rector of Housing Programs for 
the NAACP, has to say about 
methods to combat this evil. 
Staff workers will accompany 
Morris to this conference

Also high on the agenda is Ihe 
finalizing of plans begun at the 
October Stale Convention to 
establish a lobbying office in 
Raleigh with at least Iwu people 
to watch over the N.C. 
Legislature and lo prod the 
law makers regarding legisla­
tion which would enhance Ihe 
best interests of blacks and 
other minorities, much after the 
fashion of Clarence Milchell. Jr. 
and his very effective lobbying 
in Dee Cee over Congress.

All branches are asked to 
especially have present their 
housing chairman and as many 
others as possible to get the 
message, take il home and be 
more effective in the local 
community. All officers should 
atend. Alexander staled.

Begins
2nd Week 
As Senate 
Pagette
Miss Cyretha Irving b<»pan 

her second consecutive week of 
work as a Senate Pagette in the 
130th General Assembly last 
Monday The young Pagette is a 
student at Josep) us Daniels 
Junior High Schoo .

The first week of the Genera. 
Assembly wasa shi rt one. but a 
very interesting and informa­
tive one. Perhaps the most 
fascinating events of the week

NAMED
(Continued from p ii 

Coordinator. Miss Mitchell is a 
native of Greensboro.

Miss Mitchell will assume her 
position here on Kebruary 5. She 
is presently the project director 
for "Concerned Citizens for 
Schools”, a program sixinsored 
by the Chamber of Commerce 
in Greensboro.

Lawrence, a Wake County 
native and St. Augustine's 
graduate who has just served a 
4-month internship with the City 
of Raleigh in a Mastt. 's Degree 
program through Georgia State 
University, will immediately 
assume the job of Social 
Services Coordinator which has 
been recently established by the 
City Council. The 29-year-old 
Wray will be working with Ihe 
Citizens Advisory Council pro­
gram.

TWO STROKES
(Continued from p. 1)

The group took on two new 
members after Willa was 
married and made its first 
appearance before a white 
audience in 1957 at the Newport 
Jazz Festival. Concert tours 
and night club bookings at home 
and abroad followed.

Miss Ward was a firm 
believer in her music.

"I know the Lord," she said 
recently. "And I never have a 
lonely moment. I really kind of 
think, as far as my personal life 
is concerned, 1 got it made.”

A spokesman for United 
Artists records said the singer 
had been preparing an album 
for them.

WOIKNTO
(Continued from p. 1) 

methods of taxation and would 
like to bring the wisdom of the 
humanties to bear on this 
problem

The period after lunch will 
be devoted to general discuss­
ion. We plan to adjourn at 2:00.

MISS CYRETHA IRVING
lor Cyretha were the friendly 
chats she was able to have with 
the Lt Governor and the 
Senators. .She found that the 
majority of Ihe Senators were 
lawyer.s by profession.

The Pageltes come from all 
over the state of North Carolina. 
Many lively discussions were 
had between the Pagetles from 
Junior High Schools. Senior 
High Schools and colleges with 
various ethnic backgrounds. 
The experiences proved to be 
most educational and benefi­
cial.

C> ’'eth.i staled that she was 
hel(i s[>ellbound when the 
Governor made his address last 
Wednesday. It is a thrilling 
scene lo be in ihe Legislative 
Building and see both houses 
come together in a joint session.

Black Studies 
Council Formed

ur.:>i<»,>«iKAILS I’D .SCHtKlLBOYS • Kingston. Jamaica - Getting in shape for his heavyweight 
lille defense against George Foreman here January 22. Joe Krazier demonstrates his punch to a 
group of visiting schoolboys at the National Arena .lanuarv 12. (CPU

Some of the organizations 
Cyretha is affiliated with are:
Life .Member of the NAACP and 
a member of the International 
Youth Club. She has also been 
certified as a Junior Life Saver 
by Ihe American Red Cross.

Cyretha is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles G. Irving, Jr . 
and the granddaughter ol 
Charles C. Irving, Sr. and thi 
late Mrs. Gallic E. Irving. She 
resides with her parents at 533 
E. Lenoir Street. Raleigh.
REDECORATE HOUSE

The Samuel Alston 
family of Warren County 
has taken many steps to 
Improve the Interior of 
their house.

Included in the project 
was the redecorating of 
two bedrooms and a 
family room and the 
addition of a second bath, 
says Mrs. Bertha Forte, 
home economics exten­
sion agent.

Santa Claus Gets 
Help From NAPPE

STAFF SGT.
(Continued from p. 1) 

trative specialist for Air Force 
recruiting advertising.

The |x>st was created to 
support the all-volunteer mili­
tary effort in the region.

A Id-year Air Force veteran. 
Sergeant Tinsley has also 
served in Greece, England, 
Florida and North Dakota.

A native of Cleveland, Ohio, 
he attended Finn College there 
before entering the Air Force. 
He and his wife, Susie, have 
lived in Garner lor one year.

Sergeant Tinsley is the son of 
Mrs, Hattie B. Tinsley, Haines 
City, Fla.

TURNKEY THREE
(Continued from P. 1)

delicious full course dinner soon 
after members arrived. A good 
time was enjoyed by all.

Members in attendance not 
already mentioned are Misses 
Almma Nunn, Willa Mclver, 
Beatrice Martin, Mesdames 
Minetta Eaton, Hattie Edmond­
son, Effie Young, A. E. Brown. 
Mary Sapp. Laura Wimberly, 
and Mrs. Josephine Bryant. The 
visiting guest was Mrs. Ethel 
Greene.

PRIEST
(Continued from p. 1)

ordained to the priesthood on 
May 7, 1959 by Bishop Vincent 
Waters at the Sacred Heart 
Cathedral in Raleigh and has 
taught in North Carolina for 13 
years, as a high school teacher, 
pastor and head of the Liturgal 
Commission.

KEEP RECORDS 
Record keeping has 

proven useful to a young 
couple who recently 
attended a money man­
agement class in 
Alamance County.

Since the couple 
started keeping records, 
they are much more 
aware of how they spend 
their money and where 
the leaks in their budget 
are, explains Mrs. Ozetta 
Guye, home economics 
extension agent.

On Christmas Eve, Local 324, 
National Alliance of Postal and 
Federal Employees got Santa’s 
het|)ers together, hitched up a 
Super Chevy truck, loaded it 
wMt' Christmas food, stuffed 
boxes. Christmas turkey, put in 
four bicycles, several dolls, 
basketballs, toy trucks, puzzles, 
rain coats for boys and girls, 
knee socks and other clothings. 
For mother, some bed linens 
and several other presents. We 
jetted to Walnut Terrace just 
beating Santa's dead line to 
assure some little girls and boys 
a Merry Christmas.

This year. Local 324 adopted 
two families as our Christmas 
project. One family, on Christ­
mas Eve morning, received two 
boxes of food and a check for 
seventy-five dollars to add those 
extras that make little folk 
happy. The second family 
received the turkey dinner, 
toys, games, clothing, presents

for mother, and a stuffed box of 
food.

The success of this Christmas 
project was made possible by 
many people in the Postal and 
Federal Services. This was not 
just a union effort, it was indeed 
a human effort supported by 
union and non-union mt mbers. 
The project chairman was Rev. 
A. Horton. He and his commit­
tee are to be congratulated. 
Special congradiilations to 
Chas. Curtis, Jas. Vines, Jas. 
Young, and Ellis Jones for' 
helping with the deliveries to 
the families.

As we put away Ihe Christmas 
decorations, take down the 
mistletoe, throw out the Christ­
mas tree, our wish is that God 
will bless all of you and a Happy 
New Year.__________

Ltttht "WATCHDOG" 
Kmp you Wann all Wintar

STONYBROOK. N Y - The 
recently formed National Afri- 
cana Accreditation and Review 
Council has completed the first 
official on-site visitation of a 
university based Black Studies 
Program.

The Black Studies Program 
at SUNY Stonybrook under the 
Chairmanship of Dr. Donald 
Blackman received Mr. Curtiss 
Porter. Associate nf Ihe Black 
Studies Departmeiil. University 
of Pittsburgh. Dr. Waller 
Stewart, chairman. Black Stu­
dies, University of Massa­
chusetts; Dr. James Turner, 
director, Africana Studies Cen­
ter, Cornell University at 
Ithaca. New York as a team of 
visiting scholars to evaluate 
tne Black Studies offerings at 
that University.

The N.A.A.R.C. is an out­
growth of Ihe "Rosslyn Group" 
of 21 Black Studies profession­
als who met in June iN.Y. 
Times. June 25, 19721 at
Rosslyn. Virginia lo lay the 
guidelines tor Black Studies' 
programmatic development 
and to assess the stale of the 
art.

Black Studies chairmen and 
assixiiates attending the initial 
meeting co-hosted by Harvard 
University and the African 
Heritage Studies Association 
included: Craig Bell, Brooklyn 
College; Dr. Donald Blackman. 
SUNY Stonybrook; Harold 
Cruse, University of Michigan; 
Dr. Chester Davis, University 
of Massachusetts at Amherst; 
Dr. Ewa Eko, Bennett College; 
Dr. Ewart Guinier, Harvaril 
University; Dr. Efraim Isaac.

Harvard University; Dr, Leo­
nard Jeffries, CCNY; Dr. Lloyd 
Jolmson, Columbia University; 
Dr. Daniel Mayers, Brooklyn 
College; Charles .Mosley, Chi­
cago Slate University; Curtiss 
E. Porter, University of Pitts­
burg’'; Wesley Profit, Harvard 
University; Dr. Walter Stewart, 
Mt. Holyoke College; Dr. James 
Turner. Cornell University; 
Melvin Wade. Vassar College.
******** 
* Army * 
! ROTC *
* Newsbeat ** • 
********

Forl.v-five soldiers in Ger­
many are members of an ex­
clusive group—the "Winged 
Foot Societ.v."

The.v earned the honor by 
running what one of them — 
Sgt. Paul F. Rhodes-called 
"the roughest six miles 
I’ve ever been across" in 
less than one hour. The 
challenge to make the 
"Marathon" run was issued 
by Ool. Jolm R, Hdok. Cdm- 
manding Officer of the 6Bth 
Air Defense Artillery Group 
at Wurzburg. Germany.

The wInner-Sgt. Marshall 
R. Ledesma-crossed the 
finish line after the gruel­
ing cross-country run in 34 
minutes and 12 seconds-a 
time that even surprised 
him.

"I really didn't think I 
could run that fast," Sgt. 
Ledesma said.
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OlteOniMM OBEMVIUK

Now Open

Trice’s Capitol Square. 
Special uaily

BREAKFAST LUNCH DINNER 
CATERING SERVICE AVAILABLE 
HOURS; MON. - THU. ;:30-9;30 
FRI. A SAT. 1:31) a.m.- 3 a.m.
106 S. Wllmhiguin St. Phone 833-5172 Frink irk*. Ovanr

ARRANGEMENTS
... w« w«lcom« your 
inquiries. So often 
people ore faced with 
their lack of knowledge 
at a time when making 
decision! it necessary. 
It's wise to be aware 
of what has to be 
dene, before death

Funeral Home, Inc
Over a halt century of service lo Raleigh and communuy

Raleigh Mutual Burial Associattoo
Low Cost Funeral Insurance AvaUable 
 322 E. CABARRUS ST. — PHONE 832-2835 


